
Building Inspections - Re: permit application 

I was just notified by the owner he is going to wait till next year  to build garage
Thank you
Roland J Poulin jr
207-232-5050

On Tuesday, April 14, 2015 3:00 PM, Building Inspections <buildinginspections@portlandmaine.gov> wrote:

The Inspections Division has made repeated attempts to reach you regarding your application but has 
been unsuccessful. Please provide an updated application as required or contact our office at (207) 874-
8703 within the next 48 hours. If no response is received your permit application will be terminated.

>>> Building Inspections 4/6/2015 8:54 AM >>>
The Inspections Division has received your application, has done a preliminary completeness check of 
your documents and entered the application in our system. Payments can be made by mail, in person, 
or online at Pay your Invoice
Please reference the Application ID number when submitting your payment. This number is found at 
the top of your invoice.

This is not an approval of your permit. Work cannot commence until the permit is issued.

You can review the status of your permit on line,
http://www.portlandmaine.gov/792/Permit­Status

Your total amount due is: $245.00

>>> Roland Poulin Jr <renovationsplusinc@yahoo.com> 3/27/2015 10:21 AM >>>
please review and let me know if you need more info
Roland 207-232-5050
Thank you

Notice: Under Maine law, documents - including e-mails - in the possession of public officials 
or city employees about government business may be classified as public records. There are 
very few exceptions. As a result, please be advised that what is written in an e-mail could be 
released to the public and/or the media if requested.   

From: Roland Poulin Jr <renovationsplusinc@yahoo.com>
To: Building Inspections <buildinginspections@portlandmaine.gov>
Date: 4/14/2015 3:43 PM
Subject: Re: permit application

Page 1 of 1

4/14/2015file:///C:/Users/bjs/AppData/Local/Temp/XPgrpwise/552D35A0PortlandCityHall1001676...


