
CITY OF PORTLAND

389 Congress Street
Portland, Maine  04101

HOUSING SAFETY OFFICE

Inspection Violations

 Owner/Manager

FORTY NINE LLC 

 CBL

081  A010001

 Location

202 DARTMOUTH ST

 Inspector

David Petruccelli

 Status

Failed

 Inspection Date

2/10/2017

 Inspection Type

Legalize Nonconforming units

Code Int/Ext Floor AreaUnit No. Compliance Date

69.20

Knox Box Requi

Notes:

Violation:

1)

PORTLAND FIRE DEPARTMENT CHAPTER 10 SECTION 12 KNOX BOX REQUIRED; KNOX 
BOXES ARE REQUIRED FOR ALL BUILDINGS WITH FIRE ALARM OR SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS.

80.16

Emergency light

Not working on floor 1Notes:

Violation:

2)

NFPA 101-7.9.3 EMERGENCY LIGHTS REQUIRE MAINTENANCE; 7.9.3  Periodic Testing of 
Emergency Equipment

7.9.3.1  Required emergency lighting systems shall be tested in accordance with one of the three 
options offered by 7.9.3.1.1, 7.9.3.1.2, or 7.9.3.1.3.

7.9.3.1.1  Testing of required emergency lighting systems shall be permitted to be conducted as follows:

(1) Functional testing shall be conducted monthly with a minimum of 3 weeks and a maximum of 5 
weeks between tests, for not less than 30 seconds, except as otherwise permitted by 7.9.3.1.1(2).

(2) The test interval shall be permitted to be extended beyond 30 days with the approval of the authority 
having jurisdiction.

(3) Functional testing shall be conducted annually for a minimum 1-1/2 hours if the emergency lighting 
system is battery powered.

(4) The emergency lighting equipment shall be fully operational for the duration of the test required by 
7.9.3.1.1(1) and (3).

(5) Written records of visual inspections and tests shall be kept by the owner for inspection by the 
authority having jurisdiction.

80.46

Fire Doors Must

Self-closing hinges required on unit doors and mechanical/laundry spacesNotes:

Violation:

3)

NFPA 101- 7.2.1.8.1 FIRE DOORS MUST BE SELF- OR AUTO-CLOSING; A door leaf normally 
required to be kept closed shall not be secured in the open position at any time and shall be self-closing 
or automatic-closing in accordance with 7.2.1.8.2, unless otherwise permitted by 7.2.1.8.3.

55.15

Fire Alarm Syst

12 units in buildingNotes:

Violation:

4)

NFPA 101- 31.3.4.1.1 FIRE ALARM SYSTEM REQUIRED; Apartment buildings four or more stories in 
height or with more than 11 dwelling units, other than those meeting the requirements of 31.3.4.1.2, 
shall be provided with a fire alarm system in accordance with Section 9.6, except as modified by 
31.3.4.2 through 31.3.4.6.
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55.25

Smoke Alarms 

Photo-electric technology requiredNotes:

Violation:

5)

NFPA 101- 31.3.4.5.1 SMOKE ALARMS REQUIRED; In buildings other than those equipped through 
out with an existing, complete automatic smoke detection system, smoke alarms shall be installed in 
accordance with 9.6.2.10, as modified by 31.3.4.5.2, outside every sleeping area in the immediate 
vicinity of the bedrooms and on all levels of the dwelling unit, including basements.

91.15

Exposed Wiring

laundry room above dropped ceilingNotes:

Violation:

6)

NFPA 70- ARTICLE 110.12 B EXPOSED WIRING CONNECTIONS; Internal parts of electrical 
equipment, including busbars, wiring terminals, insulators, and other surfaces, shall  not be damaged or 
contaminated by foreign materials such as paint, plaster, cleaners, abrasives, or corrosive residues. 
There shall be no damaged parts that may adversely affect safe operation or mechanical strength of 
the equipment such as parts that are broken; bent; cut; or deteriorated by corrosion, chemical reaction, 
or overheating.

Comments:


