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Here’s our lease agreement.  Hope the scan is ok.

John Leighton


On Jun 26, 2014, at 8:57 AM, Building Inspections <buildinginspections@portlandmaine.gov> wrote:


As previously reported, your permit application is on "hold" until proper documentation of right/title/interest has been provided.  This is just a notification and

invoice.  Please see attached for info on the process.


The Inspections Division has received your application, has done a completeness check of your documents and entered the application in our system.A

representative will contact you to make payment arrangements.If you haven’t heard from our office in 24/48 hours, please call 207-874-8703 to make payment

or arrangements.Your total amount due is:$245an invoice has been attached to this e-mail for your convenience.


>>> "Craig Smith" <csmith66@maine.rr.com> 6/23/2014 10:42 PM >>>

Good day.


Please accept our revised submission.  As requested, separate pdf’s have been created and renamed accordingly.


Thank you,


Craig


From:Building Inspections [mailto:buildinginspections@portlandmaine.gov]

Sent:Monday, June 23, 2014 9:47 AM


To:Craig Smith

Cc:thomasleightons@icloud.com; 'Olof Smith'


Subject:Re: General building permit application - Parlour LLC


Craig, all your documents need to be separate PDFs and named correctly.

Please review theApplicant Submittal Requirements for Electronic Plan Review.  (http://www.portlandmaine.gov/DocumentCenter/View/2303.) Please

resubmit your entire application with the appropriate changes and supporting documents accordingly.


>>> "Craig Smith" <csmith66@maine.rr.com> 6/19/2014 10:39 PM >>>

Please accept our revised permit application.


Thank you,


Olof I. Smith


207­712­3813


Notice: Under Maine law, documents - including e-mails - in the possession of public officials or city employees about government business may be classified as public

records. There are very few exceptions. As a result, please be advised that what is written in an e-mail could be released to the public and/or the media if requested. 
<101 Hanover St (137 Kennebec) rptInvoice.pdf><Getting a Building Permit.pdf>
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