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Building Inspections - RE: CofO fee - 446 Fore St.

From: Larry Cushing <larrycushing@outlook.com>

To: ""Building Inspections' <buildinginspections@portlandmaine.gov>
Date: 3/4/2016 11:12 AM

Subject: RE: CofO fee - 446 Fore St.

CC: ""Mark Deane'" <mark.deane@comcast.net>

We understand.

Thank you

Larry Cushing

From: Building Inspections [mailto:buildinginspections@portlandmaine.gov]
Sent: Friday, March 4, 2016 11:08 AM

To: Larry Cushing <larrycushing@outlook.com>

Cc: Mark Deane <mark.deane@comcast.net>

Subject: RE: CofO fee - 446 Fore St.

Ok, just so you know, the permit will not be issued without that fee being paid.
>>> Larry Cushing <larrycushing@outlook.com> 3/4/2016 10:57 AM >>>

We are working with the State Fire Marshal and local engineering firm. That process could take several
months.

Once we have cleared that process, we will complete the City permit process and Certificate of Occupancy fee.

Larry Cushing

From: Building Inspections [mailto:buildinginspections@portlandmaine.gov]
Sent: Monday, February 29, 2016 2:42 PM

To: larrycushing@outlook.com

Subject: Re: CofO fee - 446 Fore St.

We still have not received this payment for the Certificate of Occupancy fee on this permit application.
Please provide payment ASAP so the permit can move forward. We look forward to seeing this
payment soon; thank you.

This is not an approval of your permit. Work cannot commence until the permit is issued.
>>> Building Inspections 2/18/2016 2:36 PM >> >
An invoice has been attached to this e-mail. Payments can be made by mail, in person, or online at Pay

your Invoice Please reference the Application ID number when submitting your payment. This
number is found at the top of your invoice. Your total amount due is: $100.00
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>>> Christina Stacey 2/18/2016 2:24 PM >>>
Hi,

Permit #2015-02432 for 446 Fore St. actually involves a change of use. When you have a second can you send
an invoice for the CofO fee? It would be best to send it to Larry Cushing at larrycushing@outlook.com

Thanks so much,
Chris
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