
Ann Machado - Re: additionally insured


Thank you Ann.


Due to us moving our primary entrance, I have decided not to use an awning at this time. We will move

forward with our sign plans and will resubmit an application when I decide what to use in place of our

awning.


thanks,

Ken


On Thu, Jun 25, 2015 at 10:08 AM, Ann Machado <AMACHADO@portlandmaine.gov> wrote:


Ken -
Are you saying that you are not going to have an awning? I just need you to confirm this in an email.

I have signed off on the sign for zoning. It still needs to be reviewed by a building code plan reviewer.

Ann


Ann Machado

Zoning Administrator

Planning & Urban Development

Portland, Maine

(207) 874-8709

>>> Ken Bell <kenbellhospitality@gmail.com> 6/25/2015 10:00 AM >>>

Hello Ann,

I just wanted to follow up and see if you have everything that you need. I have decided not to utilize my

awning, but I do still want my sign hung. Do you have all the info that you need?


thanks

Ken


On Mon, Jun 22, 2015 at 8:10 AM, Ann Machado <AMACHADO@portlandmaine.gov> wrote:


Matt -
You can send the pdf directly to me.

Thanks.

Ann


Ann Machado

Zoning Administrator

Planning & Urban Development

Portland, Maine

(207) 874-8709

>>> Ken Bell <kenbellhospitality@gmail.com> 6/20/2015 10:58 AM >>>


From: Ken Bell <kenbellhospitality@gmail.com>

To: Ann Machado <AMACHADO@portlandmaine.gov>

Date: 6/25/2015 10:10 AM

Subject: Re: additionally insured
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Matt, I have cc'd Ann Machado in this email. She is requesting the cert. of insurance for the city of Portland.


Thanks,

Ken


On Jun 17, 2015 1:37 PM, "Matthew Dennett" <matt@lotfeydennett.com> wrote:

Hey Ken


Can you forward me the contact info of who is asking of this again? Not bothering me at all, not your

fault! Clearly something they are not receiving at the City of Portland so I want to get to the bottom of it

so they stop hounding us for the same thing time and time again.


Thanks


On Tue, Jun 16, 2015 at 11:55 AM, Ken Bell <kenbellhospitality@gmail.com> wrote:

hello Matt,

sorry to bother you with this again, but the city continues to ask for "additionally insured certificate". I

have not been saving the email for this, but I will moving forward. could you please resend this for

me?


thanks

Ken


--
Ken Bell


Portland House Of Music and Events (H.O.M.E.)

25 Temple St.

Portland ME

04101


--
Matthew Dennett

Owner/Broker


Lotfey Dennett Insurance Brokers

Insurance Solutions for Small Business & Individuals

PO Box 15010

Portland, ME 04112

p: 207.557.9340 f: 866.433.6694

www.lotfeydennett.com


--
Ken Bell


Portland House Of Music and Events (H.O.M.E.)
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http://www.lotfeydennett.com


25 Temple St.

Portland ME

04101


--
Ken Bell


Portland House Of Music and Events (H.O.M.E.)

25 Temple St.

Portland ME

04101
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