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Portland. _
Ves. Google's good here Ann Machado <amachado@portlandmaine.gov>
Maine

Transportation fund

James Dealaman <jdealaman@portlandmaine.gov> Fri, Mar 30, 2018 at 10:53 AM
To: "Cameron, Caitlin" <ccameron@portlandmaine.gov>, Philip DiPierro <pd@portlandmaine.gov>
Cc: Barbara Barhydt <bab@portlandmaine.gov>, Ann Machado <amachado@portlandmaine.gov>

| just received two checks, each for $6,280.60, in-lieu of 2 parking spaces. I'm copying Ann on this email thread.

Just to reiterate, it appears there is a Housing Trust Fund contribution that may still be needed.

On Wed, Mar 28, 2018 at 4:26 PM, James Dealaman <jdealaman@portlandmaine.gov> wrote:
Caitlin, In case he comes in, any idea how many parking spaces he's looking to pay in-lieu for?

Also, noticed that the Housing Trust Fund condition is still unmet, which requires $290,000 before the C/O is issued.
Just to keep on the radar.

On Wed, Mar 28, 2018 at 3:25 PM, Jennifer Munson <jmy@portlandmaine.gov> wrote:
Barbara,

Jimmy handles these. | forwarded your e-mail to him.

Jennifer Munson, Office Manager
Planning and Urban Development
City of Portland

389 Congress St., 4th Floor
Portland ME 04101
jmy@portlandmaine.gov

(207) 874-8719

(207) 756-8258 (fax)

[Quoted text hidden]

James Dealaman, Administrative Officer

Planning and Urban Development Department

City Hall, 389 Congress Street, 4th Floor

Portland, Maine 04101

(207) 874-8721 (T)

(207) 756-8258 (F)

planning@portlandmaine.gov

www.portlandmaine.gov

Office Hours are Monday - Friday 8:00 a.m. - 4:00 p.m.

James Dealaman, Administrative Officer
Planning and Urban Development Department
City Hall, 389 Congress Street, 4th Floor
Portland, Maine 04101
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