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Building Inspections - RE: Seaport Lofts Plumbing Permit; 113 Newbury St

From: Benjamin Bettez

To: Building Inspections; Terri McPherson

Date: 8/18/2015 9:13 AM

Subject: RE: Seaport Lofts Plumbing Permit; 113 Newbury St

113 Newbury is clear. Real estate taxes are due September 12 but nothing is past due.

Benjamin Bettez

Administrative Officer

Department of Planning & Urban Development

City of Portland

389 Congress Street

Portland, Maine 04101

(207) 874-8721 (T)

(207) 756-8258 (F)

bbettez@portlandmaine.gov

>>> Building Inspections 8/18/2015 8:24 AM >>>

The Inspections Division has received your application, has done a preliminary completeness check of
your documents. Before we can move forward with the submittal, there are some outstanding fees due
on this account. Please consult Benjamin Bettez at 874-8721 (for fees). Once the outstanding balance

has been paid, we can move forward with the permitting process. Thank you.

>>> Terri McPherson <Terri@granite-corp.com> 8/17/2015 11:20 AM >>>
I can tell it's one of those days.

Sorry and here it is.

Thanks

From: Building Inspections [mailto:buildinginspections@portlandmaine.gov]
Sent: Monday, August 17, 2015 11:19 AM

To: Terri McPherson <Terri@granite-corp.com>

Subject: Re: Seaport Lofts Plumbing Permit

Terri, you didn't attach anything. Also, you need to wait until you receive an invoice. It will detail when/how you
can pay.

>>> Terri McPherson <Terri@granite-corp.com> 8/17/2015 11:09 AM >>>
Here is Seaports Lofts Plumbing Permit. How do you want me to send you the Credit Card #

Thanks
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Terri McPherson
Controller

Granite Corp

PO Box 370
Oakland, Me 04963
207 465-9229
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